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Accelerating Telecom Innovation: Intel 
& SUSE Join Forces to Revolutionize 
Telecom Infrastructure

The telecom industry faces unprecedented challenges, 
from meeting customer demands and staying ahead of 
competition to ensuring security and reliability. To succeed, 
telcos must innovate faster than ever before. That's why 
Intel and SUSE are collaborating on optimized support for 
Granite Rapids-D with the upcoming SUSE Linux 
Enterprise Server 15, Service Pack 7. Granite Rapids-D is 
Intel's game-changing processor, featuring the latest 
generation of P-cores, that promises significant gains in 
performance and power efficiency utilizing improved AVX 
for vRAN instructions and integrated vRAN Boost 
acceleration. 

This partnership is pivotal for telcos, enabling them to 
expedite service and revenue stream delivery through 
optimized processor utilization, while also unlocking new 
growth opportunities and keeping their customers' data and 
services safe with robust security and reliability - all thanks 
to our open-source expertise in building strong 
infrastructure foundations. Meet us at Mobile World 
Congress and discover how this collaboration is driving 
telecom innovation forward!

https://more.suse.com/M
WC25.html
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